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FCS Approved Toilet 

Paper/Sofidel 

Heavenly Soft 

#410035 (Jumbo Roll 

2ply 1000'x3.5")

5000 12 $26.02 $130,100.00 $26.73 $133,650.00 $39.75 $198,750.00 $26.72 $133,600.00 $69.89 $349,450.00 $35.00 $175,000.00 $92.50 $462,500.00 $63.50 $317,500.00 $53.46 $267,300.00 $77.14 $385,700.00 $28.72 $143,600.00 $72.84 $364,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

America's 1st MaintMid-States ServicesVeritiv OperatingSeatac LLC
Safety & Occupational 

Supplies
Busyhands Int'l LLCBarrett ProcurementSiak Enterprise LLCHubzone Depot LLC Liberty ProcurementContact Group SolutionsConServ Company

Notes

Rolls Per 

Case

Atlantic Paper

Low Bid Meeting Terms & 

Cinditions

B25-01- Toilet 

Paper

Estimated 

Case Quantity

Imperial Dade
Always Available 

Wholesales

Southeastern Paper 

Group
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